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American International Group, Inc. 
 
American International Group, Inc. (NYSE: 
AIG)  
70 Pine St. 
New York, NY 10270     
Phone: 212-770-7000 
Fax: 212-509-9705  
Website: http://www.aig.com 
 

Employees:                         81,000  
Revenue:             $55,459,000,000 
Net Income:          $5,363,000,000 
Assets:               $492,982,000,000 
Liabilities:         $440,832,000,000 
(As of December 31, 2001) 
 

Description: Helmed by financial legend Maurice "Hank" Greenberg, American International 
Group (AIG) is one of the world's largest insurance firms.  Best known domestically as a leading 
provider of property & casualty and specialty insurance, AIG also has strong life insurance 
operations abroad and is a presence in financial services and asset management (purchases have 
included leading annuities firm SunAmerica and other companies specializing in retail financial 
markets).  Other operations include auto insurance, mortgage guaranty, annuities, and aircraft 
leasing. 
 
Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-K for the period ending December 31, 2002 at 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012303003570/y65998e10vk.txt 
Filed On: March 31, 2003 
 
Asbestos and Environmental Claims 
 
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter referred to collectively as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. 
 
The vast majority of these asbestos and 
environmental claims emanate from policies 
written in 1984 and prior years. AIG 
established over a decade ago specialized 
toxic tort and environmental claim units, 
which investigate and adjust all such 
asbestos and environmental claims. These 
units utilize a comprehensive ground up 
approach to claim adjusting by thoroughly 

evaluating each exposure on a claim by 
claim basis. Commencing in 1985, standard 
policies contained an absolute exclusion for 
pollution related damage and an absolute 
asbestos exclusion was also implemented. 
However, AIG currently underwrites 
environmental impairment liability 
insurance on a claims made basis and has 
excluded such claims from the analyses 
included herein. 
 
Estimation of asbestos and environmental 
claims loss reserves is a difficult process. 
These asbestos and environmental claims 
cannot be estimated by conventional 
reserving techniques as previously 
described. Quantitative techniques 
frequently have to be supplemented by 
subjective  
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considerations including managerial 
judgment. Significant factors which affect 
the trends which influence the development 
of asbestos and environmental claims are 
the inconsistent court  resolutions and 
judicial interpretations which broaden the 
intent of the policies and scope of coverage. 
The current case law can be characterized as  
still evolving and there is little likelihood 
that any firm direction will develop in the 
near future. Additionally, the exposure for 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites involves issues such as allocation of 
responsibility among potentially responsible 
parties and the government's refusal to 
release parties. 
 
In the interim, AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of the 
policy coverage and the liability issues. At 
the current time, it is not possible to 
determine the future development of 
asbestos and environmental claims with the 
same degree of  reliability as is the case for 
other types of claims. Such development 
will be affected by the extent to which courts 
continue to expand the intent of the policies 
and the scope of the coverage, as they have 
in the past, as well as by the changes in 
Superfund and waste dump site coverage 
issues. Although the estimated liabilities for 
these claims are subject to a significantly 
greater margin of error than for other 
claims, the reserves carried for these claims 
at December 31, 2002 are believed to be 
adequate as these reserves are based on the 
known facts and current law. Furthermore, 
as AIG's net exposure retained relative to 
the gross exposure written was lower in 
1984 and prior years, the potential impact of 
these claims is much smaller on the net loss 
reserves than on the gross loss reserves. In 
the future, if the environmental claims 
develop 

deficiently, such deficiency would have an 
adverse impact on future results of  
operations. (See the previous discussion on 
reinsurance collectibility herein.) 
 
The majority of AIG's exposures for asbestos 
and environmental claims are excess 
casualty coverages, not primary coverages. 
Thus, the litigation costs are treated in the 
same manner as indemnity reserves. That is, 
litigation expenses are included within the 
limits of the liability AIG incurs. Individual 
significant claim liabilities, where future 
litigation costs are reasonably determinable, 
are established on a case basis. 
 
In asbestos, for example, AIG has resolved 
all claims with respect to miners and 
product manufacturers (Tier 1), for which 
payments are completed or reserves are 
established to cover future payment 
obligations. Asbestos claims with respect to 
products containing asbestos (Tier 2) 
accounts are generally very mature losses, 
and have been appropriately recognized 
and reserved by AIG's asbestos claims 
operation. AIG believes that the vast 
majority of the incoming claims, with 
respect to products containing small 
amounts of asbestos and companies in the 
distribution chain and parties with remote, 
ill-defined involvement with asbestos (Tier 3 
and 4), should not impact its coverage; this 
is due to a combination of factors, including 
the increasingly peripheral companies being 
named in asbestos litigation, smaller limits 
issued to peripheral defendants, tenuous 
liability cases against peripheral defendants, 
attachment points of the excess policies, and 
the manner in which resolution of these 
weaker cases would be allocated among all 
insurers, including non-AIG companies, 
over a long period of time. 
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Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-Q for the quarter ended  September  30, 2002 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012302010792/y65072e10vq.htm 
Filed On: November 14, 2002 
 
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter collectively referred to as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. Estimation 
of asbestos and environmental claims loss 
reserves is a difficult process, as these 
claims, which emanate from policies written 
in 1984 and prior years, cannot be estimated 
by conventional reserving techniques. 
Asbestos and environmental claims 
development is affected by factors such as 
inconsistent court resolutions, the 
broadening of the intent of policies and 
scope of coverage and increasing number of 
new claims. AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of 
policy coverage and the liability issues. If 
the courts continue in the future to expand 
the intent of the policies and the scope of the 

coverage, as they have in the past, 
additional liabilities would emerge for 
amounts in excess of reserves held. This 
emergence cannot now be reasonably 
estimated, but could have a material impact 
on AIG’s future operating results. The 
reserves carried for these claims as at 
September 30, 2002 ($2.09 billion gross; 
$687 million net) are believed to be adequate 
as these reserves are based on known facts 
and current law.  
       
AIG’s general insurance companies have a 
special asbestos and environmental (A & E) 
claims unit actively managing A & E claims. 
AIG’s experienced claims professionals 
evaluate case reserves for AIG losses at the 
earliest possible time, reserving to ultimate 
probable loss based upon known facts, 
current law, jurisdiction, policy language 
and other factors. AIG routinely reviews the 
adequacy of A & E case reserves. AIG does 
not discount A & E reserves.  

 
Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-Q for the quarter ended  June  30, 2002 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012302007551/y62622qe10vq.htm 
Filed On: August 8, 2002 
 
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter collectively referred to as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. Estimation 
of asbestos and environmental claims loss 
reserves is a difficult process, as these 
claims, which emanate from policies written 
in 1984 and prior years, cannot be estimated 

by conventional reserving techniques. 
Asbestos and environmental claims 
development is affected by factors such as 
inconsistent court resolutions, the 
broadening of the intent of policies and 
scope of coverage and increasing number of 
new claims. AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of 
policy coverage and the liability issues. If 
the courts continue in the  
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future to expand the intent of the policies 
and the scope of the coverage, as they have 
in the past, additional liabilities would 
emerge for amounts in excess of reserves 
held. This emergence cannot now be 
reasonably estimated, but could have a 

material impact on AIG’s future operating 
results. The reserves carried for these claims 
as at June 30, 2002 ($2.14 billion gross; 
$701 million net) are believed to be adequate 
as these reserves are based on known facts 
and current law. 

 
Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-Q for the quarter ended  March  31, 2002 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012302005156/y60050e10-q.htm 
Filed On: May 15, 2002 
 
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter referred to collectively as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. The vast 
majority of these asbestos and 
environmental claims emanate from policies 
written in 1984 and prior years. AIG has 
established a specialized claims unit which 
investigates and adjusts all such asbestos 
and environmental claims. Commencing in 
1985, standard policies contained an 
absolute exclusion for pollution related 
damage. However, AIG currently 
underwrites environmental impairment 
liability insurance on a claims made basis 
and excluded such claims from the analyses 
included herein.  
       
Estimation of asbestos and environmental 
claims loss reserves is a difficult process. 
These asbestos and environmental claims 
cannot be estimated by conventional 
reserving techniques as previously 
described. Quantitative techniques 
frequently have to be supplemented by 
subjective considerations including 
managerial judgment. Significant factors 
which affect the trends which influence the 
development of asbestos and environmental 
claims are the inconsistent court resolutions 

and judicial interpretations which broaden 
the intent of the policies and scope of 
coverage. The current case law can be 
characterized as still evolving and there is 
little likelihood that any firm direction will 
develop in the near future. Additionally, the 
exposure for cleanup costs of hazardous 
waste dump sites involves issues such as 
allocation of responsibility among 
potentially responsible parties and the 
government’s refusal to release parties.  
       
In the interim, AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of the 
policy coverage and the liability issues. At 
the current time, it is not possible to 
determine the future development of 
asbestos and environmental claims with the 
same degree of reliability as is the case for 
other types of claims. Such development 
will be affected by the extent to which courts 
continue to expand the intent of the policies 
and the scope of the coverage, as they have 
in the past, as well as by the changes in 
Superfund and waste dump site coverage 
issues. Although the estimated liabilities for 
these claims are subject to a significantly 
greater margin of error than for other 
claims, the reserves carried for these claims 
at March 31, 2002 are believed to be 
adequate as these reserves are based on the 
known facts and  
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current law. Furthermore, as AIG’s net 
exposure retained relative to the gross 
exposure written was lower in 1984 and 
prior years, the potential impact of these 
claims is much smaller on the net  loss 
reserves than on the gross loss reserves. In 
the future, if the environmental claims 
develop deficiently, such deficiency would 
have an adverse impact on future results of 
operations. (See the previous discussion on 
reinsurance collectibility herein.)  

       
The majority of AIG’s exposures for asbestos 
and environmental claims are excess 
casualty coverages, not primary coverages. 
Thus, the litigation costs are treated in the 
same manner as indemnity reserves. That is, 
litigation expenses are included within the 
limits of the liability AIG incurs. Individual 
significant claim liabilities, where future 
litigation costs are reasonably determinable, 
are established on a case basis.  

 
Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-Q for the quarter ended  September  30, 2001 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012301508357/y54461e10-q.htm 
Filed On: November 14, 2001 
 
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter referred to collectively as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. The vast 
majority of these asbestos and 
environmental claims emanate from policies 
written in 1984 and prior years. AIG has 
established a specialized claims unit which 
investigates and adjusts all such asbestos 
and environmental claims. Commencing in 
1985, standard policies contained an 
absolute exclusion for pollution related 
damage. However, AIG currently 
underwrites environmental impairment 
liability insurance on a claims made basis 
and excluded such claims from the analyses 
included herein.  
       
Estimation of asbestos and environmental 
claims loss reserves is a difficult process. 
These asbestos and environmental claims 
cannot be estimated by conventional 
reserving techniques as previously 
described. Quantitative techniques 
frequently have to be supplemented by 

subjective considerations including 
managerial judgment. Significant factors 
which affect the trends which influence the 
development of asbestos and environmental 
claims are the inconsistent court resolutions 
and judicial interpretations which broaden 
the intent of the policies and scope of 
coverage. The current case law can be 
characterized as still evolving and there is 
little likelihood that any firm direction will 
develop in the near future. Additionally, the 
exposure for cleanup costs of hazardous 
waste dump sites involves issues such as 
allocation of responsibility among 
potentially responsible parties and the 
government’s refusal to release parties. 
The cleanup cost exposure may significantly 
change if potential Congressional 
reauthorization of Superfund dramatically 
changes the current program.  
       
In the interim, AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of the 
policy coverage and the liability issues. At 
the current time, it is not possible to 
determine the future development of 
asbestos and environmental claims with the  
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same degree of reliability as is the case for 
other types of claims. Such development 
will be affected by the extent to which courts 
continue to expand the intent of the policies 
and the scope  of the coverage, as they have 
in the past, as well as by the changes in 
Superfund and waste dump site coverage 
issues. Although the estimated liabilities for 
these claims are subject to a significantly 
greater margin of error than for other 
claims, the reserves carried for these claims 
at September 30, 2001 are believed to be 
adequate as these reserves are based on the 
known facts and current law. Furthermore, 
as AIG’s net exposure retained relative to 
the gross exposure written was lower in 
1984 and prior years, the potential impact of 
these claims is much smaller on the net loss 

reserves than on the gross loss reserves. In 
the future, if the environmental claims 
develop deficiently, such deficiency would 
have an adverse impact on future results of 
operations. (See the previous discussion on 
reinsurance collectibility herein.)  
       
The majority of AIG’s exposures for asbestos 
and environmental claims are excess 
casualty coverages, not primary coverages. 
Thus, the litigation costs are treated in the 
same manner as indemnity reserves. That is, 
litigation expenses are included within the 
limits of the liability AIG incurs. Individual 
significant claim liabilities, where future 
litigation costs are reasonably determinable, 
are established on a case basis.  

 
Asbestos Discussion from SEC filings: 
From the Company’s Form 10-Q for the quarter ended  June  30, 2001 
http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/5272/000095012301505557/y52044e10-q.txt 
Filed On: August 14, 2001 
  
AIG continues to receive claims asserting 
injuries from toxic waste, hazardous 
substances, and other environmental 
pollutants and alleged damages to cover the 
cleanup costs of hazardous waste dump 
sites (hereinafter referred to collectively as 
environmental claims) and indemnity claims 
asserting injuries from asbestos. The vast 
majority of these asbestos and 
environmental claims emanate from policies 
written in 1984 and prior years. AIG has 
established a specialized claims unit which 
investigates and adjusts all such asbestos 
and environmental claims. Commencing in 
1985, standard policies contained an 
absolute exclusion for pollution related 
damage. However, AIG currently 
underwrites environmental impairment 
liability insurance on a claims made basis 
and excluded such claims from the analyses 
included herein. 

  
Estimation of asbestos and environmental 
claims loss reserves is a difficult process. 
These asbestos and environmental claims 
cannot be estimated by conventional 
reserving techniques as previously 
described. Quantitative techniques 
frequently have to be supplemented by 
subjective considerations including 
managerial judgment. Significant factors 
which affect the trends which influence the 
development of asbestos and environmental 
claims are the inconsistent court resolutions 
and judicial interpretations which broaden 
the intent of the policies and scope of 
coverage. The current case law can be 
characterized as still evolving and there is 
little likelihood that any firm direction will 
develop in the near future. Additionally, the 
exposure for cleanup  
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costs of hazardous waste dump sites 
involves issues such as allocation of 
responsibility among potentially responsible 
parties and the government's refusal to 
release parties. The cleanup cost exposure 
may significantly change if potential 
Congressional reauthorization of Superfund 
dramatically changes the current program. 
 
In the interim, AIG and other industry 
members have and will continue to litigate 
the broadening judicial interpretation of the 
policy coverage and the liability issues. At 
the current time, it is not possible to 
determine the future development of 
asbestos and environmental claims with the 
same degree of reliability as is the case for 
other types of claims. Such development 
will be affected by the extent to which courts 
continue to expand the intent of the policies 
and the scope of the coverage, as they have 
in the past, as well as by the changes in 
Superfund and waste dump site coverage 
issues. Although the estimated liabilities for 
these claims are subject to a significantly 
greater margin of error than for other 

claims, the reserves carried for these claims 
at June 30, 2001 are believed to be adequate 
as these reserves are based on the known 
facts and current law. Furthermore, as AIG's 
net exposure retained relative to the gross 
exposure written was lower in 1984 and 
prior years, the potential impact of these 
claims is much smaller on the net loss 
reserves than on the gross loss reserves. In 
the future, if the environmental claims 
develop deficiently, such deficiency would 
have an adverse impact on future results of 
operations. (See the previous discussion on 
reinsurance collectibility herein.) 
 
The majority of AIG's exposures for asbestos 
and environmental claims are excess 
casualty coverages, not primary coverages. 
Thus, the litigation costs are treated in the 
same manner as indemnity reserves. That is, 
litigation expenses are included within the 
limits of the liability AIG incurs. Individual 
significant claim liabilities, where future 
litigation costs are reasonably determinable, 
are established on a case basis. 

 
Asbestos-Related News: 
American International CEO Plays Down Asbestos Charges (Published January 31, 2003) 
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